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Part 1: Introduction 

Dear Jon Wilson: 

Thank you for ordering your personal Name Report.  Your report based on the 
Kabalarian Mathematical Principle demonstrates the relationship between your 
name, your mind, and your purpose in life (called your birthpath, which is 
revealed by your date of birth). Your name and birthpath must harmonize for 
ultimate happiness and success. This analysis will provide you with a better 
understanding of yourself--your thinking patterns, personality characteristics, 
interests, aptitudes, and the degree of success you have realized in your life. 

The report comprises several parts: 

PART 2 - Analysis of Your Names 

PART 3 - Your Birthpath 

PART 4 – Relationships and Compatibility 

PART 5 - Career Selections in Relation to your Birthpath 

PART 6 - Recommendations and Further Services  

PART 7 - Free Telephone Support 

PART 8 - Kabalarian Ethics of Right Thinking 

Important: Please read this report carefully and advise us immediately of any 
errors in the spelling of your name(s) or date of birth as this will have a definite 
effect on the accuracy of this report.  

The information contained in this report is vital to your future.  It could be a 
turning point in your life. A whole new understanding of yourself will open up to 
you. 

We are always ready to assist you in furthering your understanding of life.  
Greater happiness, peace of mind, and fulfilment can be yours. 

Sincerely, 
 
The Office Staff 
http://www.kabalarians.com/cfm/SearchDocs/MeetStaff.cfm 
Society of Kabalarians 
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Part 2: Analysis of Your Names 

Analysis Based on the English Language 

Your names are analyzed in this Name Report using the 26-letter English 
alphabet. However the effect of your names in English will be modified 
somewhat if, in addition, your name is taken from a language with a different 
alphabet.  We would be pleased to discuss this matter with you. Please take 
advantage of the telephone support included with your Name Report. 

Middle Names 

Middle names do not have an influence on your personality and are not analyzed 
unless you are called by your middle name or if your middle name is used in your 
business signature. 

Introduction to the Principle behind Name 

The value of a name has long been immortalized in prose, poetry, and religious 
ceremony. Everyone recognizes himself or herself by name.  The question is:  
how does your name influence your entire life? 

Human beings are able to reason and create on a conscious level because of 
language. The symbols of language convey forces of conscious intelligence, 
which are focused on the individual through the name(s) used. Thus name 
represents the nucleus of one’s mind and thinking. 

As you read through the details of each of your names, you will notice there are 
specific contrasts between one name and another resulting in conflicting desires 
and ambitions. This is the basic cause of restrictions which will affect your 
personal fulfilment and success in business affairs.  The degree of balance and 
harmony between your names determines the expression of your inner potential. 

The never changing sequence of an alphabet allows mathematical measurement.  
Each letter by its position in the alphabet expresses a degree of intelligence. In 
considering the influence of name, what is important is the power of intelligence 
that expresses through the alphabetical symbols comprising your name. This 
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intelligence can be defined, measured, and correlated thus determining the 
personality, the degree of harmony, and the results in your life. 

The body is responsive to the mind. When the mind expresses discordant 
characteristics, the body reflects the discord as illness. For instance, hypertension 
can cause ulcers or headaches. The questions are: What causes the hypertension in 
the first place? Why does it affect different people in different ways? A study of 
name and its effect upon personality and health will reveal the answers to these 
questions. 

Video Explanation 

Click the following link to view a 5-minute video which explains the basic 
principle of how your name through language creates your mind and life: 

http://www.kabalarians.com/cfm/nrmovie-embedded.cfm 

 



Name Report for:  Jon Wilson Birthdate:  February 25, 1983 

Society of Kabalarians of Canada REP36945.doc (Printed on 10/8/2009) Page: 5 

Your First Most Used Name 

As Jon, you have a natural interest in the welfare of your fellow man, and a desire 
to help and serve others in a humanitarian way. You are responsible and generous, 
although somewhat scattering and disorganized at times. Any jobs requiring 
systematic and conscientious effort, or involving any form of drudgery, dismay 
you. In your work, you would seek a position offering self-expression through 
contact with people, such as sales or teaching, or a position giving scope to your 
creative, artistic talents. You enjoy music, and probably like to sing--not 
necessarily professionally--but perhaps while at your work, or when at social 
gatherings. You are good-natured and likeable, and people tend to confide in you 
and seek your advice in personal problems. Others sense your sincere interest and 
desire to help, and you can always be counted on to see the bright side of any 
problem. You enjoy making others happy and you never let your own problems 
"get you down" for any length of time, even though you do tend to worry too 
much at times. Your optimism can be a source of inspiration to others as well as 
yourself. In close personal relationships you are usually thoughtful and 
considerate. However, your natural interest in others, coupled with your 
sympathetic reaction to problems, could draw you into emotional situations which 
may be difficult to get out of. This is quite a healthy name, but any problems in 
the health could be created through a liking for sweets, with the resultant 
overheated bloodstream and skin rashes. 

Your Surname 

The surname Wilson has created a family that is serious and responsible, yet 
friendly. Home life, standing among friends, and positions in the community are 
all very important to these people. They have respect for family traditions and full 
regard for their responsibility to their family and community. They have a natural 
ability for understanding others and putting them at ease. Adept at handling 
people, they are gracious hosts. They may be inclined, however, to live too much 
for association, and attract into their lives many people who have little to offer as 
friends, intellectually, or materially. Others often come to them for sympathetic 
understanding which they can count upon receiving. Members of this family must 
guard against becoming too involved personally with others, or becoming a party 
to gossip. Through their understanding of people, they can often give very good 
advice to others, yet they lack the determination and self-confidence to apply their 
advice to themselves. Procrastination results over hesitation in making decisions 
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and taking positive action. Under such circumstances they worry excessively. 
They are not inclined towards physical or manual labour, preferring instead to 
work in a responsible administrative position where they have contact with 
people. Because there is appreciation for refinement and culture in this family, 
they try to have in their homes the finer and better things. Weaknesses in the 
health could cause worry and conditions relative to the fluid functions of the 
body; for example, kidney and bladder disorders, poor circulation, varicose veins, 
or obesity. 

Your Combined Name 

Your full name of Jon Wilson gives you the desire for sociable conditions with a 
minimum of responsibility. Although you like variety and try to evade long-term 
commitments, the creative activities you attract often serve little gainful purpose. 
Many bitter experiences occur with people who let you down or draw you, against 
your better judgment, into undesirable circumstances. You do not have stable 
conditions because changes often interfere with reaching your original goals. 
Restlessness, lack of consistency and routine, and lack of sustained interest or 
effort hamper progress and the accomplishment of your goals. These names cause 
mood swings that, in turn, can affect your eating habits, even causing you at times 
to be over-indulgent. 

Your Business Signature 

To the extent that you use the business signature of John Wilson, it would restrict 
your opportunities for progress and success. You are invariably tied to positions 
involving detail and routine requiring technical ability and also some skill at 
communication. You work hard but the remuneration is not in keeping with the 
efforts you put forth  The progress you make comes through a steady, persistent 
effort and taking advantage of small opportunities. 

Your Other First Name(s) 

Your name of Jonny gives you a clever, logical mind, and you could do almost 
anything you put your mind to. Because of your ability to analyze a situation or 
problem quickly, you could develop a superior air towards those who are slower 
in their thinking. You have always taken your responsibilities seriously and can 
be depended upon to do a good job. You are very independent and like to make 
your own decisions without interference from others. You have the ability to 
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provide quick sound answers to the problems of others. This trait coupled with 
your desire to help could sometimes cause you to be thought of as interfering. 
You desire settled, stable conditions in your life and enjoy to be with your family. 
You are very self- confident and not inclined to lose your head in a crisis. You are 
prone to take life too seriously and a weakness of this name is excessive worry 
over problems and responsibilities. You should learn to take a relaxed, happy 
attitude toward life. 

The name of John causes you to take your responsibilities seriously. You love the 
security of a home and family and are fond of children. Although you have good 
business judgment, you are not too aggressive in your dealings because you do 
not like to create issues. You would be successful in any position dealing with the 
public as you have a diplomatic and tactful manner and can put people at ease. 
You have the desire to help your fellow man and ease some of the suffering in the 
world. You have a patient and kind nature, and people are drawn to you because 
they feel that you are understanding and responsive. While you are honest and 
responsible, one weakness that is paramount in your life is your lack of 
self-confidence and initiative. You must learn not to depreciate your abilities; 
rather, you must strive to exert your will to do what you know should be done. 
Generally speaking, you have few problems with your health; however, there is a 
weakness affecting the fluid functions of the body, which could cause serious 
problems later in life. 

The name of Jon-Boy gives you a very happy, generous nature with a great desire 
to serve your fellow man. However, your emotional feelings are very deep and 
you are inclined to let your heart rule your head, so to speak. You can be musical 
and artistic but lack the shrewdness necessary for business success. Under this 
name you must have a constructive outlet through some form of self-expression or 
your health could suffer, in which case you could be subject to nervous troubles, 
goitre, or skin problems. 

Your Other Combined Name(s) 

The full name of Jonny Wilson gives you the desire for inspirational, 
spontaneous, and creative experiences. Many opportunities for success in your 
undertakings come your way, particularly through your association and contact 
with others. You attract positions in which you manage finances and direct the 
efforts of others. Your level of success, of course, depends on the efforts you are 
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willing to make. Since you have expensive tastes and want the best in life, you 
have a need for financial independence and all that financial success includes. 
Any weakness in your health would show in the reproductive organs. 

Your full name of John Wilson gives you the desire for creative outlets, for much 
sociability, and for opportunities to give to and share with others. Although you 
want active conditions and variety in your life, you are constantly dealing with 
mundane, monotonous details. You are taken into surroundings where much hard 
work is required of you, but you receive little in proportion to your efforts. You 
can make progress through much perseverance and taking advantage of the 
limited opportunities that do come your way. The successes you have are the 
result of focused efforts. Seldom do favourable conditions come your way. Any 
health weaknesses would show in skin, liver, or stomach problems. 

Your Previous First Name 

Your name of Michael gives you a clever, logical mind, and you could do almost 
anything you put your mind to. Because of your ability to analyze a situation or 
problem quickly, you could develop a superior air towards those who are slower 
in their thinking. You have always taken your responsibilities seriously and can 
be depended upon to do a good job. You are very independent and like to make 
your own decisions without interference from others. You have the ability to 
provide quick sound answers to the problems of others. This trait coupled with 
your desire to help could sometimes cause you to be thought of as interfering. 
You desire settled, stable conditions in your life and enjoy to be with your family. 
You are very self- confident and not inclined to lose your head in a crisis. You are 
prone to take life too seriously and a weakness of this name is excessive worry 
over problems and responsibilities. You should learn to take a relaxed, happy 
attitude toward life. 

Your Previous Combined Name 

The full name of Michael Wilson gives you the desire for inspirational, 
spontaneous, and creative experiences. Many opportunities for success in your 
undertakings come your way, particularly through your association and contact 
with others. You attract positions in which you manage finances and direct the 
efforts of others. Your level of success, of course, depends on the efforts you are 
willing to make. Since you have expensive tastes and want the best in life, you 
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have a need for financial independence and all that financial success includes. 
Any weakness in your health would show in the reproductive organs. 

Your Other Business Signature(s) 

To the extent that you use the business signature of J. Wilson, it would cause 
instability and unpredictability in your affairs. Although you may strive to 
organize your business dealings, budgeting or financial planning would be 
difficult because money tends to go out as fast as it comes in. Your inclination to 
be overly generous in response to the needs of others often leaves you in difficult 
circumstances. Good luck more often than good management often saves you 
from difficult situations. Opportunities that come to you can turn out to be 
unprofitable, as conditions do not permit proper completion of your efforts. 
Invariably, early expectations would not be realized. Success is thus limited and 
you could experience many disappointments in your financial affairs. 

To the extent that you use the business signature of J. M. Wilson, it brings you a 
degree of financial stability and success but it does not enable you fully to realize 
your expectations and ambitions. It involves you in responsibilities, which you 
take very seriously, perhaps to the extent of worry. You are taken into situations 
in which contact with others is restricted and your efforts and capabilities 
unrecognized. Opportunities usually go to someone else. This signature attracts 
many misunderstandings in your business dealings, thus spoiling your ability to 
negotiate the most favourable terms, or to bring arrangements to a completely 
satisfactory conclusion. 
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Part 3: Your Birthpath Based on your Birth Date 

Everything in life has a reason for being, a purpose.  For example, when an acorn 
under proper conditions eventually grows to become an oak tree thousands of 
times the size of the seed itself, the reason or potential within the seed has 
fulfilled its purpose. 

Your purpose became seeded on a specific date with the first breath of life. The 
birthpath is calculated from the day, month, and year of birth. The potential 
indicated by the birthpath consists of qualities to be developed through your 
thinking and the resultant actions.  These qualities may be inspirational, technical, 
or a combination of both. 

Important Note: 

The calculation of your birthpath in the following section is based on the widely 
used Gregorian calendar, which is recognized internationally.   For births around 
midnight, the day of birth is always determined according to standard time, and 
not daylight-saving time, if it is in effect.  A birth occurring in the half-hour 
between midnight and 12:30 am (standard time) is treated as occurring on the 
previous day. 

Please contact the office so that we can revise your Name Report if your time of 
birth was in either of the following periods: 

•  Midnight to 12:30 am standard time 

•  Midnight to 1:30 am daylight-saving time 
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Your Birthpath Purpose 

Birthpath for Your Birth date: February 25, 1983 

Within you is a high-spirited, active quality with the inclination to be free to 
express your energies in artistic pursuits, drama, entertainment, and humour, or in 
promotion.  You could excel along any avenue that does not restrict your 
spontaneous and expressive nature through too much attention to detail.  Your 
imaginative, innovative potential could find expression in literary composition or 
journalism.  Contact with people is necessary in the expression of your purpose.  
You require the opportunity to express cosmopolitan, optimistic, generous, and 
buoyant qualities to bring inspiration and happiness to others. 

Originality in self-expression is your keynote, the highest evolution being the 
ability to lift and educate others to a better way of life.  Success in educating 
others requires in-depth understanding of people, comprehension of the principles 
upon which life is based, and self-discipline over such qualities as intolerance, 
argumentativeness, or self-centredness.   The emotional power within you should 
be directed into constructive channels to allow you to fulfil your destiny of 
uplifting and leading people to the realization of new and basic truths of life. 

Finding time to be on your own, preferably in the out-of-doors, would allow you 
to think about life, to plan your efforts, and to write down your thoughts and 
ideas.  Cultivate your inborn philosophical and scientific interest  through 
comtemplating the phenomena of nature, the cycles of time, and the universal 
power of life that expresses through all living things.   

Learning to concentrate and finish what you start would teach you patience, the 
joy of accomplishment, and self-confidence.  Otherwise, you would be subject to 
a scattering influence that will thwart the completion of your undertakings.  

Everything in life has a reason for being, a purpose.  For example, when an acorn 
under proper conditions eventually grows to become an oak tree thousands of 
times the size of the seed itself, the reason or potential within the seed has 
fulfilled its purpose. 

Your purpose became seeded on a specific date with the first breath of life. The 
birthpath is calculated from the day, month, and year of birth. The potential 
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indicated by the birthpath consists of qualities to be developed through your 
thinking and the resultant actions.  These qualities may be inspirational, technical, 
or a combination of both. 

It is essential that your name is harmonized or balanced to your birthpath in order 
that you accomplish what you are meant to in life. 

A name with opposite qualities to the birthpath does not allow the balanced, 
natural expression and unfoldment of your purpose. It creates many expressions 
of frustration, unhappiness, and lack of fulfilment which result from desiring one 
thing but attracting something else.  When the name is not in harmony with one’s 
purpose, the result is turbulence, discontentment, and stress.  

 

Your Minor Lessons 

Your birth date is divided into three distinct periods of life known as the minor 
lessons.  Your first minor lesson is determined by the calendar month of birth 
and covers the personal development period of life, beginning at birth and ending 
at 27 years of age.  Childhood represents the foundation of life upon which should 
be built discipline, health, intelligence, love, ideals of service, and an appreciation 
for all humanity. 

Your second minor lesson is determined by the day of the month of birth and 
covers the most active period of time from 27 to 54 years of age and determines 
the basic group of each person.  All people belong to one of three basic groups: 
practical, social, or inspirational.  The terms used in the Kabalarian Philosophy 
are water (practical), fire (social), and air (inspirational) groups. 

Your year of birth is the third and last minor lesson and covers the period of time 
from 54 to the close of life.  It represents the fruition period of life when each 
person should give back of his or her knowledge of life so others may benefit 
from the shared experiences. 

Each period gives an opportunity to unfold a quality which is a component of 
your birthpath potential as determined by the date of birth. 
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Your 1st Minor Lesson 

From  birth to 27 brings the lesson of merging and working with people, using 
diplomacy and finesse to create understanding in your associations. Your lesson is 
to develop the confidence and individuality of mind to mingle with people 
without being swayed by them, to understand others, and to help them in the 
solution of their problems. You are responsible for creating rapport when there is 
discord and differences in opinion. Your developing perception of situations and 
your intelligent, clever use of language would help to eliminate discord and 
misunderstandings. Progress could thereby be achieved through harmony. Facing 
and dealing with issues while retaining your own individuality and clarity of 
thought could be a challenge, yet is an attainable expression of your birthpath 
potential. When people would come to you for advice, you must recognize the 
importance of respecting and retaining confidences. 

Your 2nd Minor Lesson 

From  27 to 54 is a time to develop your natural studious, concentrative, 
philosophical qualities, to seek truth and the answers to the intriguing mysteries of 
life.  During this time you would find yourself being less expressive, desiring to 
be on your own to ponder life. Your qualities portray the thinker, the theorist, and 
the writer. All the beauty of nature touches you deeply and, in your search for 
truth, you could find many answers to life reflected in the phenomena and 
rhythms of nature.  It is important to learn placidity of mind, and to take the time 
to contemplate and reflect upon the deeper aspects of life. You could find a 
natural interest in mathematics, or other scientific fields. The inspirational 
qualities of your potential could be developed through music, art, or drama. 

Despite the sensitivity and solitary qualities of your inner nature, it is important to 
learn the lessons of generosity and thoughtfulness toward others, to be happy, and 
communicative. 

Your 3rd Minor Lesson 

From age 54 on represents a time for expression in inspirational endeavours such 
as art, music, drama, composition, singing, and public speaking which can uplift 
and encourage others through creative, intelligent, humorous expression. 
Generosity is another attribute to be developed during this time in your life.  You 
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would be successful in any position in which you could express your 
cosmopolitan qualities personally, spontaneously, and creatively, free from 
monotony or limitations. By learning system and order, you would overcome any 
tendency to scatter your efforts and to leave projects incomplete. Your natural 
affection for, and caring of, others must find constructive outlets; otherwise, you 
could be drawn into frivolous emotional encounters and bitter experiences.     
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Part 4: Relationships and Compatibility based on your Birthpath 

Groups 

All people belong to one of three basic groups: practical, social, or inspirational.  
In the Kabalarian Philosophy we call these groups: water (practical), fire (social), 
and air (inspirational) groups.  You are in the Water Group. 

The day of the month when one is born determines the group.  Each group has a 
specific role in life and the group signifies the basic nature of the purpose within 
each person and, as well, indicates the conditions necessary for personal growth. 
The group is part of the birthpath quality. Whether this quality finds a natural 
expression depends upon the names used, for the names create the personality of 
each person and his or her destiny in life.  Name is the predominant determining 
factor in each person’s growth and development. 
 

Table of Groups 

Group Day of Birth 

Water 1, 5, 7, 10, 14, 16, 
19, 23, 25, 28 

Fire 2, 4, 8, 11, 13, 17, 
20, 22, 26, 29, 31 

Air 3, 6, 9, 12, 15, 18, 
21, 24, 27, 30 

Each group water, fire, or air express in specific ways. 

The water group expresses in a matter-of-fact, direct, independent way, and is 
responsible for establishing the practical understanding of life.  Water group 
members learn through their own efforts in self-education and self-discipline to 
become leaders sharing with others the benefit of their experiences.  They are 
self-sufficient and creative but have to guard against being self-centred.  Those in 
the water group appreciate the outdoors and find harmony and peace in nature. 
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The fire group has the lesson of responsibility, the lesson of association, working 
for and with others, coinciding viewpoints and educating and organizing others.  
Those in the fire group often learn through the fire of experience until they base 
their decisions on definite principles and are not swayed by others.  They are not 
highly inspirational, as they seek proof through fact and logic.   

The air group is here to contribute through self-expression and creative, artistic 
achievement.  Air group members have the potential to develop universal 
understanding to lead the minds of others into progressive, constructive channels 
of thought and creativity.  Being idealistic and inspirational, they should express 
affection and generosity.  Since they feel deeply about the welfare of humanity, 
they can be over-emotional, temperamental, and unrealistic if not living the higher 
side of their nature.  

Compatibility 

People born into the same group can experience a natural kinship, especially if 
their names have relative mathematical qualities.  They tend to observe life from a 
similar perspective, think and feel in a similar way, and enjoy similar activities. 
However, discord in the name can distort the natural compatibility of people in 
the same group.   

Therefore, if you are married to or associating with someone born into a different 
group, an opportunity awaits you to gain an understanding of life from another 
perspective.  Being in different groups need not spoil long-term happiness, 
especially when each person strives to appreciate and understand the viewpoints 
and the challenges that face the other person.  As you can appreciate, there are 
many factors to consider in creating close compatibility.  Creating co-operation 
and understanding between people is one of life’s many challenges, yet necessary 
in generating harmony and fulfilment. 

You are in the: ==> Water Group <== 

In business associations, friendships, and marriage, you will find the most 
congeniality with those who are also in the water group.  Members of the water 
group work best on their own; they are tenacious and work hard to accomplish 
their goals.  Because of their extreme independence and individuality, and their 
self-focused approach to life, they are inclined to disregard advice and overlook 
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the sensitivities of others.  They like to do things their own way. They are not as 
verbally expressive as people in the fire and air groups. 

Merging with the Other Groups 

Those in the water group find it easier to merge with those in the fire group than 
with those in the air group.  It is important to fire group members to blend and to 
get along with others; they find it easier than do people in the water and air groups 
to set aside their own opinions and desires to avoid issues and to create harmony.  
Fire group members do not tend to interfere with the independence of those in the 
water group. Therefore, without clear understanding of the reasons that create the 
differences, friction may result in close association. 
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Part 5: Career Selections in Relation to your Birthpath 

The opportunity to choose and develop a career relative to the qualities of your 
inner nature is an important aspect to consider in the overall happiness and 
success of your life.  If the wisdom of the Kabalarian Philosophy were known and 
understood, all children would be named in harmony with their birthpaths.  Since 
the time of birth denotes the quality and potentialities of the power of life seeded 
within each person, the names given would contain qualities that allow the 
birthpath expression through the developing personality.  Parents would know 
how to educate and guide their children with greater understanding. 

The names used lead to particular vocations and avocations that may or may not 
be relative to the inner potential.  It is the name that determines destiny through 
the quality of mind, the cause for one’s path in life.  Comparison between the 
name and the birthpath will reveal the degree of harmony or discord that has 
resulted, as well as the degree of satisfaction and contentment experienced in 
work. 

It may not be practical to change your occupation.  You may have already 
invested years in education or accumulated experience in a specific field.  If this 
is the case, we suggest that you consider pursuing personal projects, such as 
hobbies, natural to your intrinsic qualities.  The freedom and personal satisfaction 
gained would help to lessen any unhappiness and frustration created by your 
present occupation, and may even change or enhance your work performance, 
because you will be happier and more relaxed. 

You may also consider building upon your existing vocation to assume other 
responsibilities more in keeping with the natural expression of your birthpath. 

If you decide to work toward a career change, consider the importance of a 
change of name and understand the mental qualities required to handle the new 
occupation.  Investigate the particulars of the vocation under review and the 
education that may be required.  Then plan the steps carefully. This is where our 
telephone support services can assist you. 

The following are only a few suggestions of work environments in which you 
could find fulfilment and success for your birthpath purpose: 
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Career List 
Business 
Real Estate Appraiser 
Insurance Adjuster 
Realtor 
Market Research Analyst 
Fashion/Image Consultant 
 
Communications 
Reporter/Columnist 
Author 
Journalist 
 
Design 
Artist 
Commercial Photographer 
Illustrator 
Creative Inventor 
Florist 
Fashion Designer 
Graphic Illustrator 
Interior Designer 
Landscape Designer 
Display Designer 
 
Entertainment 
Actor/Actress 
Musician 
Composer/Arranger 
Writer Humourist 
Poet 
 
Education 
Teacher 
Professor 
Historian 
 
Services 
Ecologist 
Horticulturalist 
Naturopath 
Research Lawyer 
Veterinarian 
 
Miscellaneous 
Travel Agent 

 

 

Whether you are drawn into any of these occupations is dependent upon the 
degree of harmony between your name and birthpath. 
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Evaluation 

Take the time to evaluate each part of your report to understand your inner needs 
and the environments necessary to allow the birthpath its natural expression.  

You have been introduced to the influence on your life of your names and date of 
birth.  There is a reason for all experiences, thought patterns, and inner desires.  
There are many external factors involved in moulding the patterns in our lives but 
each person responds according to the influence of his or her name.  It is most 
important to identify these influences and to make necessary positive changes. 

This careful evaluation coupled with person-to-person discussion with one of our 
representatives will provide the basis for progressive changes in your life. 
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Part 6: Recommendations and Further Services 

From your analysis, we recognize that your present names have some fine 
qualities and have allowed a certain degree of accomplishment and success. 
However, your names as you have read also include definite drawbacks that 
detract from your general well-being, health, financial success and stability, 
and will interfere with your long-term personal happiness and fulfilment. 

In order to benefit fully from your Name Report, our recommendation to you is to 
take advantage of one of the following services to address these problems and 
create greater balance in your life: 

Telephone Support 

Call us today to take advantage of the free telephone support previously described 
in Part 7. 

To discuss any questions you may have regarding your Name Report, we are 
pleased to offer you a free half-hour support session. You can receive this 
support in one or several calls.  This time will assist you to maximize the benefits 
from your Name Report. Our friendly supportive staff look forward to your call.  

Take advantage of this opportunity to understand yourself better and investigate 
the relationship of your name and date of birth. Call us today! 

How to arrange your session 

Regular office hours are from Monday to Friday 8:30 am to 3:30 pm Pacific 
Time, but other times may be arranged.  Please call our head office to schedule an 
appointment: 

•  866-489-1188 toll-free from anywhere in North America 

•  604-263-9551 for international locations and Greater Vancouver  

We will then arrange a convenient time for you to speak to one of our Name 
Report specialists.  

Balanced Name™ Recommendation Service 

Our comprehensive Balanced Name Recommendation service will help you in 
the selection of a balanced name that will change the conditions in your life. Your 
choice and use of a balanced name will harmonize your thinking with the natural 
qualities of your birthpath. 

Drawing on over 70 years experience in making name recommendations we will 
work with you in making this important step. Establishing a balanced name is 
essential to overcoming the limitations found in your present names. 

Our Balanced Name Recommendation service includes: 
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•  a selection of balanced name recommendations (full changes and in some 
cases modified changes) for your consideration 

•  description of the qualities of the balanced names recommended for you 
and what they will do for you 

•  what is the best business signature to use to ensure stability and success in 
your business affairs and projects 

•  on-going consultation support to help you choose the recommended name 
that is right for you  

•  practical advice on how best to proceed in changing your name 

To find out more about how you can benefit from a Balanced Name 
Recommendation call us today.  

 
Introductory Course - Life Analysis Training 

Life Analysis Training is the first in a series of Life Focusing Programs that will 
enable you to analyze your thinking and reactions, and thereby learn the reasons 
for your experiences. You will be able to understand and deal with your partner, 
your children, your family and friends, and your business associates in a way that 
creates harmonious, successful interaction.  

Understanding human nature will provide you with the basic key to making 
positive changes and creating personal happiness and fulfilment.   

The Life Analysis Training program includes lesson materials, workbook, and 
CDs as well as personal support services provided by our professional 
consultants.  Life Analysis Training is offered through: 

•  Correspondence for home study 

•  On-Line Web-Based Program 

•  2-Day weekend seminars 

•  10-week night school courses in established centres 

Please call us to discuss registration options and payment plans. 
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Part 7: Question and Answer - Telephone Support 

There are many nuances and subtleties to the influence of your names which 
affect the expression of your birthpath potential (determined by your date of 
birth). 

Questions clients frequently ask 

•  Are my names in harmony with my birthpath potential? 

•  Can you expand on the relationship between my name and birth date? 

•  How will learning these principles assist to improve my relationships, 
health, and personal and business conditions? 

•  What is the difference between the Kabalarian Philosophy and 
numerology? 

•  Does the attachment of a name affect a business, pets, etc.? 

Free half-hour telephone support 

To discuss any questions you may have regarding your Name Report, we are 
pleased to offer you a free half-hour support session. You can receive this 
support in one or several calls.  This time will assist you to maximize the benefits 
from your Name Report. Our friendly supportive staff look forward to your call.  

Take advantage of this opportunity to understand yourself better and investigate 
the relationship of your name and date of birth. Call us today! 

How to arrange your session 

Regular office hours are from Monday to Friday 8:30 am to 3:30 pm Pacific 
Time, but other times may be arranged.  Please call our head office to schedule an 
appointment: 

•  866-489-1188 toll-free from anywhere in North America 

•  604-263-9551 for international locations and Greater Vancouver  

We will then arrange a convenient time for you to speak to one of our Name 
Report specialists. 

Support by e-mail 

Though having a discussion over the telephone is the best, this dialogue can also 
take place by e-mail.  Please e-mail us with your questions to: 
     
   ordercenter@kabalarians.com  
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Meet the Staff 

        http://www.kabalarians.com/cfm/SearchDocs/MeetStaff.cfm 

How To Contact Us  

Head Office - Vancouver, Canada 
5912 Oak Street 
Vancouver, BC  V6M 2W2 
Canada 
Tel: 866-489-1188 - free North America 
Tel: 604-263-9551 - International 
Fax: 604-263-5514 

EUROPE - Holland 
Roelandt Kugul 
Marktstraat 72H, 9581 AD 
Musselkanaal, Holland 
Tel: 011-31-5996-50634 

Fax: 011-31-5994-17983 

Calgary, Alberta, Canada 
Ronaye Willington 
2618 Richmond Road SW 
Calgary, AB  T3E 4M4 
Tel and Fax: 403-246-0926 
 

Edmonton, Alberta, Canada 
Floyd and Marlaina Farrell 
7764 - 83rd Avenue 
Edmonton, AB  T6C 1A4 
Tel: 780-466-7369   Fax: 780-469-1591 

Further Information 

Our internet web site at http://www.kabalarians.com has extensive information 
and articles which covers various topics on the Kabalarian Philosophy. 

Email:   ordercenter@kabalarians.com 
 

We need your feedback! Complete our Name Report survey 

We need your feedback on your Name Report. It will take less than 2 minutes to 
complete and really assist us in our efforts to serve you better. 

Click the following link to go to the confidential survey page: 

http://www.kabalarians.com/cfm/Survey-NR.htm 
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Part 8: Kabalarian Ethics of Right Thinking 
Appreciate and respect the Power of the Word (speech); never misuse this power by swearing, 

vulgarity, lying and deceit, falsifying another’s statement, or destroying the reputation of others. 

Strive to govern moods and habits so as to create peace and happiness within your own mind and 
to share that peace and happiness with others through happy, constructive thoughts, through little acts 
of generosity and service, and through seeing good and God in others. Acts of giving never go 
unrewarded. 

Always endeavor to develop an open mind, giving credit to others for mental effort even though 
they may not as yet have discovered the true light of wisdom. 

Stand in awe at the threshold of wisdom in humbleness and in deep respect. Remember that 
wisdom expressed through you is not of your creation but always was. Your endeavor to fit and 
balance your mind to your higher consciousness of wisdom is your sacred duty and not optional. 

Only through constant striving to eliminate bad or negative thoughts and habits can your mind 
feel justly proud to be a sacred part of Divine Consciousness. Mistakes sometimes occur – a mistake is 
not evil – it may occur through wrong evaluation or sometimes through over-anxiousness, or 
comparison, or undue optimism. A first mistake may be classified as an error in judgment if a lesson is 
learned from the experience; if not, then it is a conscious mistake upon a negative plane of mind, and 
serious and punishable through the law of reaction and your conscious realization that you deliberately 
created your own test and must now find the solution. 

Kill out ego and false pride. Never take the know-it-all attitude, for to do so is to kill out natural 
incentive and progress. 

Remember that your mind is the greatest instrument in the universe. As you think, so are you, 
because the nature of your thoughts indicates the plane of mind to which you are tuned; thus, your 
thinking and you are one. If you did but realize the power of your own mind for good or for 
destructiveness, you would check every thought and utterance. Do not say wrong or hurtful things for 
fun or to build up your own importance. Remember false pride comes before a fall. Never negate your 
thoughts and ideas; never say "can't" or depreciate your ability to equal or better the performances of 
others. What others have done, you can do, and do better, but do not say so; prove it in greater 
application than others, for only by effort and application shall your works be known. Never make idle 
and boastful statements; say only that which is logical and truthful. Learn to know when to speak, and 
always express your thoughts in a refined and dignified way so as to leave the best impression. 

Be systematic, proceed step by step, and learn to finish the things you start. Never make a promise 
that you cannot, or do not, intend to carry out; thus will you always speak truth. Align yourself always 
upon the side of justice, truth, and honesty. Do not meet others upon the plane of anger, wrongdoing, 
or thoughtlessness. Always use the power of analysis, particularly when in doubt. Never attempt to 
alibi that which you know is wrong. Keep your mind always upon a constructive plane of thinking. 
Remember, your sins will always find you out. 

Always seek an ideal, an objective, and the proper method of application. Create a refined and 
individual personality, a happy and generous one. Develop clean and tidy habits, body cleanliness, and 
a clean mind. Be conservative, yet creative, in your dress. Avoid showiness in dress and loudness in 
speech. Make others want to pattern themselves after you: that is a well deserved compliment, and 
indicates adherence to Kabalarian Ethics of Right Thinking. 

Alfred J. Parker   -   Founder, Kabalarian Philosophy 

Conclusion 
The Kabalarian Philosophy was founded in 1930 by Mr. Alfred J. Parker.  His life’s ideal was to 

bring an understanding of the basic universal principles of life down to a practical theory, applicable 
and of benefit to all people.  This Name Report is dedicated to that ideal.  May your Name Report 
assist you in making positive, progressive changes in your life.  We look forward to hearing from you 
soon. 

 


